

#22

NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS  
BID AWARD  
2025-A-001 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS AUTO PARTS

	<b>RATE</b>	<b>Special Item Rates</b>
AutoZone Parts	50% off list as published on <a href="http://autozonepro.com">autozonepro.com</a>	
O'Reilly Auto Parts	Minimum guaranteed discount is 41% off list price	
Safe-tyKleen Systems	7% Discount	See Catalog
B & G Auto Parts	Best wholesale or fleet price	

**All Autopart Bids Awarded**

NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS  
BIDS AWARDED  
2025-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

<b>VENDOR:</b>	Contech Engineered Solutions		
<b>DIAMETER (Inches)</b>	<b>Gage</b>		
<b>CULVERTS (price per linear foot)</b>			
12	16	\$ 13.58	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
15	16	\$ 14.59	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
18	16	\$ 20.37	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
24	16	\$ 25.80	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
30	16	\$ 32.59	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
36	16	\$ 41.74	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
42	16	\$ 48.93	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
48	14	\$ 77.72	3" x 1" Corrugation
60	14	\$ 100.08	3" x 1" Corrugation
72	14	\$ 120.99	3" x 1" Corrugation
96	14	\$ 159.82	3" x 1" Corrugation
<b>DELIVERY</b>		<b>2-4 Weeks</b>	
<b>DMP BANDS (price each)</b>			
12"	\$27.16		
15"	\$29.18		
18"	\$40.74		
24"	\$51.60		
30"	\$65.18		
36"	\$83.48		
42"	\$97.86		
48"	\$155.44		
<b>2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE</b>			
12"	2 - 12"	\$ 259.77	
15"	2 - 15"	\$ 328.98	
18"	2 - 18"	\$ 427.82	
24"	2 - 24"	\$ 605.68	
30"	2 - 30"	\$ 857.94	
36"	2 - 36"	\$ 1,092.00	
<b>DELIVERY</b>		<b>2-3 Weeks</b>	
<b>CONTACT NAME</b>	Jim Schmidt		
<b>CONTACT PHONE</b>	972-590-2000		

**Contract awarded to: ALL BIDS AWARDED**

NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS  
BIDS AWARDED  
2025-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

<b>VENDOR:</b>	<b>Wilson Culverts</b>			
<b>DIAMETER (Inches)</b>	<b>Gage</b>			
<b>CULVERTS (price per linear foot)</b>				
12	16	\$ 12.75	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation	
15	16	\$ 15.85	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation	
18	16	\$ 18.99	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation	
24	16	\$ 25.31	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation	
30	16	\$ 31.70	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation	
36	16	\$ 38.35	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation	
42	16	\$ 44.34	2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation	
48	14	\$ 72.72	5" x 1" Corrugation	
60	14	\$ 89.60	5" x 1" Corrugation	
72	14	\$ 108.30	5" x 1" Corrugation	
96	14	\$ 142.81	5" x 1" Corrugation	
<b>DELIVERY</b>		<b>10 Business Days</b>		
<b>DMP BANDS (price each)</b>				
12"		\$ 19.12		
15"		\$ 23.78		
18"		\$ 28.49		
24"		\$ 37.97		
30"		\$ 47.56		
36"		\$ 57.53		
42"		\$ 133.02		
48"		\$ 152.05		
<b>2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE</b>				
12"	2 - 12"	\$ 179.96		
15"	2 - 15"	\$ 276.94		
18"	2 - 18"	\$ 393.02		
24"	2 - 24"	\$ 601.90		
30"	2 - 30"	\$ 860.68		
36"	2 - 36"	\$ 1,188.90		
<b>DELIVERY</b>		<b>10 Working Days</b>		
<b>CONTACT NAME</b>	<b>Mason Huffines</b>			
<b>CONTACT PHONE</b>	<b>903-764-5605</b>			

NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS  
 BID AWARDED  
 2025-F-004 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FUEL FOR COUNTY VEHICLES

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Cole Distributing Company</b>		
<b>UNLEADED</b>			
<b>Grade</b>	<b>89 Octane</b>	<b>87 Octane</b>	
Rack Price		2.0360	
Tax		0.2000	
Freight		combined w/ profit margin	
Profit		0.1000	
Total Cost		2.3360	
Primary Distributor		Flint Hills Waco	
<b>DIESEL</b>			
Rack Price		2.1515	
Tax		0.2000	
Freight		combined w/ profit margin	
Profit		0.1000	
Total Cost		2.4515	
Primary Distributor		Flint Hills Waco	
<b>CONTACT NAME</b>		Brandi Mrazek	
<b>CONTACT PHONE</b>		903-872-7128	

NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS  
BIDS AWARDED FOR  
2025-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Vendor Company Name	# of Trucks	Barn to Sight/Vendor PIT	Delivery Time	Delivery Limitations	Min/Max Qty. per Ton/Truck	Per Loaded Ton					Flat Rate Charge (Hr)				
						Pct #1	Pct. #2	Pct. #3 Richland	Pct. #3 Dawson	Pct. #4	Pct #1	Pct. #2	Pct. #3 Richland	Pct. #3 Dawson	Pct. #4
D&T Services Dana Hicks 254-715-9718	1-5 or Unlimited	Barn to Sight	Varies	N/A	20 Tons Min - 25 Tons Max	\$ 12.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.25	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	No Bid	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 125.00
	Big Creek/Groesbeck					\$ 12.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.25	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	No Bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Knife River/Groesbeck					\$ 12.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.25	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Connors/Mexia					\$ 12.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.25	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Cemex/Blum					\$ 15.20	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	No Bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	HMAT/Groesbeck					\$ 12.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.25	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	No Bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Martin Marietta/Corsicana					\$ 7.50	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 125.00	No Bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Texas Bi/Malakoff					\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
	Big Creek/Corsicana (Hot Mix)					\$ 10.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	No Bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00

NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS  
BIDS AWARDED FOR  
2025-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Vendor Company Name	# of Trucks	Barn to Sight/Vendor PIT	Delivery Time	Delivery Limitations	Min/Max Qty. per Ton/Truck	Per Loaded Ton					Flat Rate Charge (Hr)				
						Pct #1	Pct. #2	Pct. #3 Richland	Pct. #3 Dawson	Pct. #4	Pct #1	Pct. #2	Pct. #3 Richland	Pct. #3 Dawson	Pct. #4
Watson Trucking Joey Watson 254-205-2055	Unlimited	Barn to Site	Any	NONE	No Min - 25 Tons Max	\$ 0.23	\$ 0.23	\$ 0.23	\$ 0.23	\$ 0.23	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Big Creek/Groesbeck					\$ 11.75	\$ 12.25	\$ 7.99	\$ 9.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Knife River/Groesbeck					\$ 11.75	\$ 12.25	\$ 7.99	\$ 9.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Connors/Mexia					\$ 12.00	\$ 12.50	\$ 8.25	\$ 9.95	\$ 12.50	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Cemex/Blum					\$ 15.64	\$ 19.55	\$ 19.30	\$ 15.47	\$ 12.75	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	HMAT/Groesbeck					\$ 11.95	\$ 12.25	\$ 8.00	\$ 9.10	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Martin Marietta/Corsicana					\$ 8.00	\$ 9.50	\$ 8.00	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.50	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Texas Bit/Malakoff (Hot Mix)					\$ 12.50	\$ 9.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 15.00	\$ 14.50	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
	Big Creek/Corsicana (Hot Mix)					\$ 9.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00

NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS  
BIDS AWARDED FOR  
2025-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Vendor Company Name	# of Trucks	Barn to Sight/Vendor PIT	Delivery Time	Delivery Limitations	Min/Max Qty. per Ton/Truck	Per Loaded Ton					Flat Rate Charge (Hr)				
						Pct #1	Pct. #2	Pct. #3 Richland	Pct. #3 Dawson	Pct. #4	Pct #1	Pct. #2	Pct. #3 Richland	Pct. #3 Dawson	Pct. #4
Montgomery Sand & Gravel Tommy Montgomery 903-875-8194	Unlimited	Barn to Site	Any	N/A	12 Tons Min - 25 Tons Max	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$200/Load -\$150 Hr	\$200/Load -\$150 Hr	\$200/Load -\$150 Hr	\$200/Load -\$150 Hr	\$200/Load -\$150 Hr
	Big Creek/Groesbeck					\$ 11.95	\$ 12.75	\$ 10.50	\$ 11.00	\$ 12.75	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Knife River/Groesbeck					\$ 11.95	\$ 12.75	\$ 10.50	\$ 11.00	\$ 12.75	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Connors/Mexia					\$ 11.95	\$ 12.75	\$ 10.50	\$ 11.00	\$ 12.75	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Cemex/Blum					\$15.00 or East of 45 \$17.00	\$ 18.50	\$ 18.50	\$ 12.80	\$ 13.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	HMAT/Groesbeck					\$ 11.95	\$ 12.75	\$ 10.50	\$ 11.00	\$ 12.75	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Martin Marietta/Corsicana					\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 9.50	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Texas Bit/Malakoff (Hot Mix)					\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Big Creek/Corsicana (Hot Mix)					\$ 25.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 25.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A





NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS  
BIDS AWARDED  
2025-R-006 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ROAD AND BASE MATERIALS BID TABULATION

Other Products offered are on last page.  
Prices shown are per ton unless otherwise specified.

I. Martin Marietta, Inc	Corsicana Plant	#57 Limestone - \$42.00/ton Limestone Sand - \$33.50/ton																																				
II. Conners Construction 2513 US Hwy 77 Lott, TX 76656 254-584-2011	Honest Ridge	1x3 rock - \$17.00/ton 3x5 rock \$15.00/ton 12" & larger rip rap \$35.00/ton																																				
III. Arcosa Aggregates 401 I-45 Frontage Rd. Ferris TX 75125 817-307-7394	Terrell TX	12"x24' Rip Rap - \$57.00/ton 3"x8" Rip Rap - \$35.00/ton																																				
IV. Ergon Asphalt 4648 Western Way	Temple, TX	Federal enviromental fee added to above prices @ rate of \$.49970/ton for asphalt & polymer loads or \$.00150/gal for emulsions loads. Bid is for full transport loads of 5,500/gal. Freight is based on a full transport loads, even if a full load of material is not ordered. The common carrier bills demurrage @ \$100/per hour after second hour. Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff. Pump & hose charge is \$100/per load. For equipment ordered, but not used, carrier may charge up to \$400.																																				
V: P2 Emulsions All listed prices are per US Gallon Minimum Tanker Delivery: 5000 Gallons Delivery over 250 Miles Subject to Additional Chrg Demurrage (trucking chrg) First 2 hrs free, \$80/hr Pump Chrg (trucking chrg) \$80 Push Charge (trucking chrg) \$80/hr Return Loads(trucking chrg) Subject to chrg Smaller Quantities Available, Subjec to Freight Differential of \$0.25/gal less than 5,000 gal	Elm Mott, TX	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Product</th> <th>Tanker FOB Plant</th> <th>Tanker FOB County</th> <th>Drum/Tote Plant</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>P2 Stabilizer</td> <td>\$2.68</td> <td>\$2.96</td> <td>\$2.90</td> </tr> <tr> <td>P2S1</td> <td>\$2.68</td> <td>\$2.96</td> <td>\$2.90</td> </tr> <tr> <td>P2 CWE-2(Chip Seal)</td> <td>\$3.01</td> <td>\$3.29</td> <td>\$3.23</td> </tr> <tr> <td>P2 CWP(Cold Weather Patch)</td> <td>\$3.01</td> <td>\$3.29</td> <td>\$3.23</td> </tr> <tr> <td>P2 ROC(Road Over Coat)</td> <td>\$2.83</td> <td>\$3.10</td> <td>\$3.05</td> </tr> <tr> <td>P2 Rejuvenator</td> <td>\$2.68</td> <td>\$2.96</td> <td>\$2.90</td> </tr> <tr> <td>P2 Prime Concentrate</td> <td>\$1.97</td> <td>\$2.24</td> <td>\$2.19</td> </tr> <tr> <td>P2RTU</td> <td>\$1.93</td> <td>\$2.20</td> <td>\$2.15</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Product	Tanker FOB Plant	Tanker FOB County	Drum/Tote Plant	P2 Stabilizer	\$2.68	\$2.96	\$2.90	P2S1	\$2.68	\$2.96	\$2.90	P2 CWE-2(Chip Seal)	\$3.01	\$3.29	\$3.23	P2 CWP(Cold Weather Patch)	\$3.01	\$3.29	\$3.23	P2 ROC(Road Over Coat)	\$2.83	\$3.10	\$3.05	P2 Rejuvenator	\$2.68	\$2.96	\$2.90	P2 Prime Concentrate	\$1.97	\$2.24	\$2.19	P2RTU	\$1.93	\$2.20	\$2.15
Product	Tanker FOB Plant	Tanker FOB County	Drum/Tote Plant																																			
P2 Stabilizer	\$2.68	\$2.96	\$2.90																																			
P2S1	\$2.68	\$2.96	\$2.90																																			
P2 CWE-2(Chip Seal)	\$3.01	\$3.29	\$3.23																																			
P2 CWP(Cold Weather Patch)	\$3.01	\$3.29	\$3.23																																			
P2 ROC(Road Over Coat)	\$2.83	\$3.10	\$3.05																																			
P2 Rejuvenator	\$2.68	\$2.96	\$2.90																																			
P2 Prime Concentrate	\$1.97	\$2.24	\$2.19																																			
P2RTU	\$1.93	\$2.20	\$2.15																																			
King Sand & Gravel Material & Delivery	Athens	Flexible Base - Type A, Grade 2, Class 2 Knife River @ Mexia Type C Rock - Aggregate: Martin Marietta, Corsicana Type D 3/8" Limestone: Martin Marietta, Corsicana																																				